
 
 

iSqFt®/Bid News Continues to Grow in Oklahoma  
 
CINCINNATI – September 25, 2009 – iSqFt, a preconstruction services company, in a follow-up 
to its recent acquisition of Tulsa-based Bid News Construction Reports, LLC, is pleased to 
announce several staffing changes in Oklahoma. 
 
Hired: Longtime Oklahoman Richard Knapp has joined iSqFt as Director of General Contractor 
Sales. Knapp’s professional experience in the commercial construction industry includes 
founding and operating a general contracting company that specialized in negotiated design-
build and renovation projects. Knapp brings over 25 years of leadership in entrepreneurial 
business operations to iSqFt’s clients. “Having been a GC myself, I understand the importance of 
watching the bottom line. I look forward to showing GCs how they can achieve productivity 
gains and create cost savings by using iSqFt.”  

Hired: Bucky Cordray has joined iSqFt as Market Manager for the Oklahoma territory. Cordray, 
a native of Oklahoma, brings experience as a Commercial Millwork Contractor. He also served 
as a Regional Sales Manager for SCM Group Machinery, where he was instrumental in 
launching a state-of-the-art technical training facility for commercial/residential millwork 
companies. “Over the years I’ve learned that relying on a network of contractors is the key to 
getting a job done on time and on budget.  I’m ready to help contractors across the state find, bid, 
and win more work by using the iSqFt Construction Network.” 

Promoted: Native Oklahoman Beth Wallace has been promoted to Market Reporting Manager 
for the Tulsa and Oklahoma City Bid News/iSqFt Plan rooms. Wallace brings with her extensive 
experience in providing information and service to all types of construction businesses through 
her tenure with Bid News. “Providing excellent customer service has always been our top 
priority,” says Wallace. “I look forward to continuing that mission by ensuring that all iSqFt 
customers have access to the latest information, including newly released government Stimulus 
projects, to assist them in finding and winning new work.” 

About iSqFt: 
Founded in 1993 as Construction Software Technologies, Inc., Cincinnati‐based iSqFt is the 
construction industry’s leading provider of online bid solicitation and preconstruction 
management services in the United States. Through strategic partnerships with the Associated 
General Contractors of America (AGC), local AGC Chapters and other industry organizations, 
the firm provides tens of thousands of general contractors, subcontractors, and suppliers in 
markets around the U.S. with online tools and solutions to increase competitiveness through 
reduced costs and increased efficiency. iSqFt is also a proud member of U.S. Green Building 
Council and is committed to the practices of sustainable design and construction. 
 
For more information about iSqFt and its applications, visit www.isqft.com. 
 
Contact: Dave Rearick, Marketing Communications Mgr. – 513.645.8004 or drearick@isqft.com 
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